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World Health Organization (WHO) estimated 1 billion 
migrants in the world today of whom 258 million are inter-
national and 763 million internal migrants [1]. Migrants, 
refugees, and asylum seekers may be both more affected by 
and vulnerable to the spread of COVID-19. In the context of 
the COVID-19 pandemic, vulnerabilities of this group have 
exacerbated since many of them are living in crowded refu-
gee camps or difficult housing conditions with limited means 
and opportunities to implement personal hygiene and social 
distancing. Consequently, COVID-19 outbreaks among this 
population can have devastating impact and have already 
been reported [2].

Recently, authors discussed in an important paper devel-
opment and production, affordability, allocation and deploy-
ment of COVID-19 vaccines [3], highlighting important bar-
riers and outlining necessary steps to implement in order to 
achieve global vaccine immunity. However, we feel that an 
important aspect relating to deployment of vaccines needs 
to be specifically highlighted: access to COVID-19 vaccina-
tion campaigns for migrants, refugees and asylum seekers.

Although sustainable health is universally considered 
a basic human right, access to healthcare systems varies 
and depends on several factors. Most countries have devel-
oped online platforms for booking appointments to rule out 
COVID-19 vaccination campaigns. This requires both the 
technical means and a regular registration status of the can-
didate booking the appointments. However, access to health-
care greatly varies across the globe. In general, legal status 
is the most important determining factor [4], with those con-
sidered “undocumented” having “a priori” limited access to 
basic services. The International Organization for Migra-
tion has estimated that 10–15% of the world’s 214 million 
international migrants were undocumented [5], suggesting 
that millions of people worldwide may have difficulty in 
accessing the vaccine. To make things more complicated, 
refugees’ and migrants’ access to basic health services may 
be further impacted by their employment status [4]. Undocu-
mented labor migrants may choose not to present to health 
care institutions because of fear of deportation [4]. Even 
with documented legal and employment status, other barri-
ers may further limit access, such as language barriers, lack 
of accessible information channels, unawareness of entitle-
ments by health care providers and beneficiaries, limitations 
of health staff expertise, and economic limitations [4].

These points highlight potential difficulties for providing 
equal access to SARS-CoV-2 vaccines for migrants and refu-
gees. They need to be proactively addressed by institutions 
and policy-makers with dedicated plans, since most standard 
administrative procedures would not allow easy access to 
vaccination programs for migrants and refugees.

The first attempt to provide equity in SARS-CoV-2 vac-
cines access was represented by the COVAX program, one 
of three pillars of the Access to COVID-19 Tools (ACT) 
Accelerator, launched in April 2020 by the WHO, the Euro-
pean Commission and France in response to this pandemic 
(https://​www.​who.​int/​initi​atives/​act-​accel​erator/​covax). 
The ACT aims to bring together governments, global health 
organizations, manufacturers, scientists, the private sector, 
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civil society and philanthropy with the aim of providing 
innovative and equitable access to COVID-19 diagnostics, 
treatments and vaccines [6]. The COVAX pillar represents 
the last ACT pillar and specifically aims, as the most urgent 
point, on equitable and universal access to vaccines. Cur-
rently, this program is working primarily in distribution 
of enough vaccines in low-to-middle income countries 
(LMICs), although the program contains in its memoran-
dum a specific section for fragile populations. The program, 
in fact, aims to develop a “humanitarian buffer, to be made 
available as a backstop mechanism to serve as a provider 
of last resort for if/when national, government-led planning 
and roll-out fail to reach certain high-risk populations in 
humanitarian settings. For example, populations living out-
side government-controlled areas could be served through 
the humanitarian buffer”. However, the statement concludes 
by highlighting the potential challenges in implementing 
such a “buffer”, explaining that “this would be implemented 
once all other options have been explored; and applicants 
would be asked to demonstrate a gap in coverage among 
relevant populations within the scope of this buffer” [7].

Currently, only few countries worldwide have active 
vaccination programs specifically including migrants and 
refuges. According to European Commission statistic data, 
there are currently around 2.6 million refugees in Europe—
mostly settled in Germany, Spain, France, Italy and Greece. 
A Pew Research Center report estimated that as many as 
4.8 million undocumented migrants were living in Europe 
in 2017—almost half of them in Germany. Here, refugees 
can access health care almost on the same basis as German 
citizens. Those who live in refugee centers are actually pri-
oritized in the vaccination campaign. The same applies to 
asylum seekers who have seen their asylum request rejected. 
In Germany, these people receive a “tolerated status”, Dul-
dung, whereby they can access certain health care. This 
program also includes access to the COVID-19 vaccines. 
The service is recognized in Germany as an “emergency 
service” and thus allows access for migrants and refugees 
with costs covered by the State [8]. The German approach 
confirms that vaccinating undocumented people is poten-
tially feasible. Outside Europe, positive experiences with 
active vaccination programs have been reported in Nepal, 
Jordan and Rwanda.

Other countries (in Europe Italy, France, UK, France, 
Belgium, Netherlands, Finland) have programs that include 
undocumented people, however on a practical day-to-day 
basis it is poorly understood how these people can access 
vaccination programs; and there are no official governmen-
tal data providing how many refugees and migrants have 
been immunized [8]. Conversely, while refugees and asylum 
seekers in Greece can in principle access vaccines, there is 
no clear provision for undocumented people, according to 
Villads Zahle from the European Council on Refugees and 

Exiles (ECRE) [9]. Some government authorities, on the 
other hand, are working to return many asylum seekers from 
refugee camps to their respective countries of origin. Others 
have explicitly excluded non-resident foreigners from the 
national vaccination program.

A more feasible approach would be to actively engage 
national and international NGOs. These could be provided 
with vaccine vials and allowed to directly reach out to 
migrants and refugees administration of vaccinations, at 
least in the traceable and known refuge/migrant population. 
Here, standard prioritization approaches can be followed, 
first aiming at those at highest risks, such as the elderly and 
people with comorbidities, i.e., like Down syndrome and 
other congenital disorders [10].

Another critical obstacle in this process is the fear of 
undocumented refugees to be recognized when participat-
ing in a vaccination program, thus risking subsequent depor-
tation. However, in the current pandemic scenario, having 
most people immunized, and particularly those living in 
fragile and crowded settings, is particularly important. In 
order to end the pandemic, it is a priority that all those eli-
gible are vaccinated since otherwise there will always be a 
risk of new outbreaks. For these specific scenarios, NGOs or 
emergency vaccination services may provide immunization 
and a paper-based vaccine certificate and ask people if they 
would like to be registered on national registries; policy-
makers and institutions may agree to include an anonymous 
code for those who wish to not be registered.

A SARS-CoV-2 vaccine campaign focused on migrants 
and refuges would have a number of specific indirect ben-
efits for children as well. Although the direct impact of the 
pandemic on children has been relatively mild, indirect 
effects like social restrictions and school closures continue 
to have a major impact on children’s health and mental well-
being [11]. The impact has been particularly devastating for 
fragile families unable to provide means for distance learn-
ing. Leaving entire communities of migrants and refuges 
unprotected would allow the virus to circulate and, indi-
rectly, again impact on children’s health. Also, while it is 
true that children mostly present with a mild-to-moderate 
clinical course of COVID-19, it is also evident that children 
from fragile backgrounds have a higher risk of developing 
more severe disease or the recently described post-COVID 
multisystem inflammatory syndrome in children (MIS-C) 
[12]. The need of protecting children, and particularly the 
most fragile, further highlights the importance of including 
migrants and refuges in SARS-CoV-2 vaccine programs.

In 2018, the WHO stated that “to achieve the vision of 
the 2030 agenda and the sustainable development goals, to 
leave no one behind, it is imperative that the health needs 
of refugees and migrants be adequately addressed” [3]. 
Thus, policies and prioritization mechanisms to ensure that 
migrants, refugees and asylum seekers are not left behind in 
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deployment strategies for COVID-19 vaccines are urgently 
needed to prevent a “transmission of vulnerability” in this 
population. Mobile vaccine-clinics reaching these communi-
ties and one-dose COVID-19 vaccines allowing refrigeration 
for storage would be of great practical benefit to respective 
immunization campaigns in this group [1].
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