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Neurocritical care developed in the interspace between 
neurology, neurosurgery, and critical care. As such, it has 
adopted many of the cultural aspects of each specialty. 
This has led to a number of incongruous treatment para-
digms that are based on the specialties that claim owner-
ship of the condition.

In this issue, we see another example of this. El-Hajj 
and colleagues [1] review the evidence for intracranial 
pressure (ICP) monitoring in the setting of commu-
nity-acquired bacterial meningitis. The studies are vari-
able in design, number of patients, inclusion of pediatric 
and adult populations, and statistical rigor. The authors 
do a good job of accounting for this variability by limit-
ing combined data assessments. Unfortunately for the 
reader and the specialty of neurocritical care, the find-
ings are suggestive that ICP monitoring is useful but not 
conclusive. The authors appropriately recommend larger 
well-constructed clinical trials to answer this question 
definitively. As such, it leaves the practitioner with little 
guidance about the appropriate approach.

There is a larger issue at play in this evaluation. The 
uncertainty of whether to monitor ICP in the setting of 
bacterial meningitis is quite different from the certainty 
with which we, as a profession, promote the use of ICP 
monitoring in traumatic brain injury (TBI) or intra-
parenchymal intracerebral hemorrhage (ICH). The data 
for improving outcome with ICP monitoring in men-
ingitis are limited and variable, but so are the data for 

ICP monitoring in TBI and ICH [2, 3]. The best expla-
nation for the poor adoption of ICP monitoring in 
meningitis and the better adoption in TBI is that men-
ingitis was traditionally managed by neurologists and 
medical intensivists and TBI was traditionally managed 
by neurosurgeons.

This begs the question of whether there are “blind 
spots” in the care of patients in the neurocritical care set-
ting that are due to traditional “disease ownership”. For 
example, seizures occur relatively frequently after acute 
ischemic stroke (AIS), aneurysmal subarachnoid hem-
orrhage, and ICH. The tradition has been to treat the 
ICH and subarachnoid hemorrhage with prophylactic 
anticonvulsants, despite little evidence to support their 
use, and only to treat patients with AIS who have dem-
onstrated seizures [4–6]. Another example is the use of 
hemicraniectomy after AIS versus ICH. The mechanism 
for herniation after both entities is similar, as is the out-
come without treatment. Yet large-scale randomized tri-
als have been conducted for AIS but not for ICH [7, 8]. 
Other incongruities are littered in the practice of neuro-
critical care, for example, the use of unfractionated hepa-
rin versus low-molecular-weight heparin in critically ill 
patients, the choice and implementation of antibiotics for 
febrile patients, and others.

Understanding the “why” may be more difficult. One 
could surmise that in the case of ICP monitoring, neu-
rologists, neurointensivists, and medical intensivists in 
many cases need to advocate for ICP monitoring device 
placement to a consulting neurosurgeon, who may not 
be as invested as they would if the patient were treated 
primarily in a neurosurgery service. This is not supported 
in the case of hemicraniectomy for AIS and ICH. Neu-
rologists and neurointensivists are still in the position to 
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advocate to a consulting neurosurgeon, but this therapy 
is considered standard of care in AIS. In contrast, hemi-
craniectomy for ICH is not standard of care even though 
patients with ICH are traditionally in the domain of neu-
rosurgery. More likely, it has to do with what paradigm 
to which particular specialties have grown accustomed. It 
is accepted in the neurosurgery culture that patients with 
severe TBI need close and advanced monitoring, whereas 
in the more medical specialties (internal medicine and 
neurology), advanced monitoring takes a back seat to ini-
tiation of definitive treatment (antibiotics in the case of 
meningitis); in fact, in the last century, the most impor-
tant debate of meningitis treatment has not been about 
monitoring ICP but about whether adjunctive corticos-
teroids improve outcomes [9].

Care in the neuroscience intensive care unit is a com-
bination of evidence-based practices, physiologically 
logical theories, ideas borrowed from other critical care 
settings, and traditional mindsets. In the absence of rig-
orously controlled randomized trials, as a field, we are 
left with making decisions based on incomplete and 
adjacent, as opposed to directly applicable, data. Laid on 
top of this decision analysis are treatment decisions that 
we favor just because “we have always done it that way”. 
What makes neurocritical care different from many other 
critical care specialties is that it grew out of three special-
ties (neurology, neurosurgery, and critical care) that have 
different answers for similar conditions in regard to “we 
have always done it that way”. This is an opportunity to 
evaluate our practice in a unique way, such as whether we 
should treat a patient with increased ICP due to TBI the 
same way as we do a patient with meningitis.
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