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Foreword

The accident at the Fukushima Daiichi Nuclear Power Plant 
in March 2011 resulted in the release of several hundred 
petabecquerels of radioactive elements into the environment. 
These radioactive elements were dispersed and deposited in 
the wide region of central Honshu Island, Japan, and atmos-
pheric and hydrological processes carried considerable frac-
tions even farther around the globe. In the 6 years since the 
accident, considerable effort has been made to reveal the fate 
and transport of these radioactive elements in major ecosys-
tems, leading to significant advancement in our understand-
ing of the relevant natural processes, as well as the effects of 
radioactivity at different levels in ecosystems.

We are honored to include several excellent papers (five 
original research articles and one short communication) 
on this in this special issue of Landscape and Ecological 
Engineering “Tracing radioactive contamination of river 
basins for the development of effective mitigation meas-
ures.” Through this issue, we aim to provide updated scien-
tific information on biogeochemical processes of radioac-
tive substances for the effective management of river basin 
systems under radioactive stresses. Listed below, the articles 
in this issue comprehensively describe the fate and transport 
of radioactive cesium mostly in forested river basins. Key 
research findings compiled here provide us with a frame-
work to explain where the radioactive cesium was dispersed 
and where it accumulated in forested rivers, how aquatic 

invertebrates and vertebrates stored and metabolized the 
radioactive cesium in their bodies/tissues, and how radio-
active cesium contaminated riparian food webs in forested 
rivers. In addition, the findings in this special issue substan-
tially enhance our fundamental understanding of ecological 
processes in forested streams as radioactive cesium serves 
as an environmental tracer.

We are grateful to all the authors, as well as the anony-
mous reviewers, who worked on this special issue; without 
their great efforts, we could not have produced it. We also 
would like to thank the International Exchange Committee 
of the Ecology and Civil Engineering Society of Japan, as it 
kindly provided us with this opportunity to make this sub-
stantial scientific contribution.
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