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Conflicts of interest in medicine are pervasive and are 
not isolated to certain practice settings or specialties. The 
Institute of Medicine defines a conflict of interest as “a 
set of circumstances that creates a risk that professional 
judgement or actions regarding a primary interest will be 
unduly influenced by a secondary interest” [1]. Medical 
professionals have a duty to minimize and disclose con-
flicts of interest in order to preserve the trust of patients 
and the public. In this editorial we focus on financial 
personal conflicts, non-financial personal conflicts, and 
conflicts that arise naturally in the role of ICU clinician, 
highlighting facets shared across medicine and challenges 
unique to the practice of intensive care medicine.

Financial personal conflicts
ICU providers may have financial ties to investigational 
devices, proprietary assays or medications, or collect 
speakers’ fees. Yet advances in intensive care medicine 
have not traditionally been industry-driven to the same 
extent as in other fields, such as oncology or cardiol-
ogy. With several notable exceptions such as drotrecogin 
alfa [2] and dexmedetomidine [3], most contemporary 
trials in critical care involve generic medications with 
other established uses (steroids, paralytics or resuscita-
tive fluids) or non-pharmacologic interventions (prone 
positioning, ventilation strategies or early vs. late renal 
replacement therapy). To the extent any financial per-
sonal conflicts exist, intensivists should comply with 
reporting mechanisms such as the Centers for Medi-
care and Medicaid Service’s Open Payments system 
[4]. The reimbursement structure in the United States 
may impact treatment decisions in ICUs, though citing 

fee-for-service as a primary determinant of decision mak-
ing over-simplifies complex practice patterns [5].

Non‑financial personal conflicts
Although financial conflicts of interest deservedly receive 
attention from professional societies and policymak-
ers, non-financial personal conflicts may be even more 
prevalent in ICUs. Advancement of scientific knowledge, 
practice innovation and improvements in patient out-
comes drive the majority of ICU investigators. However, 
secondary motivations such as career advancement and 
job security are predicated on research productivity, as 
measured by prolific publication and securing extramu-
ral funding. Pressure to enroll patients in clinical trials 
may lead to inadequate disclosure of risks, exaggeration 
of potential benefits of study participation, enrollment 
of subjects who do not meet eligibility criteria, fail-
ure to disclose adverse events to oversight committees, 
data manipulation and failure to terminate trials when 
indicated [6, 7]. A review of the incidents of research 
misconduct reported on the US Department of Health 
and Human Services Office of Research Integrity [8] 
suggested that falsified data and other misconduct are 
rarely traced to direct financial conflicts of interest, but 
are more likely to stem from academic pressures such as 
securing extramural funding, publishing manuscripts and 
advancing in academic rank [9]. Moreover, institutional 
pressure to establish and maintain research funding or 
meet enrollment rates set by clinical trial networks may 
influence patient recruitment practices [6].

The 2004 American Thoracic Society guidelines on the 
ethical conduct of clinical research recognize that “cli-
nicians who wish to enroll their own patients in studies 
have an inherent conflict of interest in that the desire to 
collect generalizable knowledge can conflict with individ-
ual patient care”. The guidelines recommend that a third 
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party obtain consent to maintain a separation between 
clinical and research practices [10].

Role conflicts
In addition to conflicts related to financial and profes-
sional advancement, intensivists face several role con-
flicts in the course of caring for critically ill patients.

Intensivists often serve as gatekeepers to the ICU. This 
role reveals a fundamental conflict between serving as 
patient advocate for patients who already occupy ICU 
beds, and serving as steward of ICU resources when con-
sidering other individuals who could potentially benefit 
from ICU admission. It is commonly held that ICU triage 
should not follow a first-come, first-served protocol, and 
should instead prioritize patients with the greatest like-
lihood of benefit [11]. Extension of that principle could 
involve transferring patients who have not improved 
after a time-limited trial of intensive care in order to 
accommodate patients for whom intensive care might 
confer a greater survival benefit. However, most intensiv-
ists report prioritizing patients already hospitalized in an 
ICU who continue to warrant ICU care over the accept-
ance of new patients [11]. This apparent contradiction 
reflects the conflict intensivists face when weighing the 
interests of their individual patients against the ethical 
obligations of allocating scare resources.

At times, the physician’s role as caretaker and educator 
conflict. As in other fields, training tomorrow’s physicians 
requires trade-offs between supervision and autonomy 
[12]. These considerations are highlighted when trainees 
must determine treatment plans for unstable patients or 
must become proficient at performing invasive proce-
dures. As a medical profession, we rarely acknowledge 
that while medical education benefits society, it exposes 
individual patients to risks with little prospect of benefit. 
For the ethical maintenance of this system, proper over-
sight for trainees is essential.

Finally, intensivists care for patients who may eventu-
ally become eligible for organ donation. Indeed, some 
physicians may hold a dual appointment in a transplant 
center. The organ procurement process has long been 
identified as a system at risk for conflicts of interest that 
could jeopardize public trust. These risks have been 
mitigated by separating the treating physicians from the 
organ donation decision and procurement processes.

Physicians with financial and non-financial per-
sonal conflicts should communicate, mitigate and 
divest in order to minimize impact on care decisions 
for their patients. A nuanced examination of the prac-
tice of intensive care medicine also exposes a number of 

non-financial role conflicts, including those between the 
role of advocating for patients currently under one’s care 
and stewarding scarce resources responsibly to promote 
public health, and, in academic settings, between the 
roles of physician, educator and investigator. Acknowl-
edging these inherent tensions is a prerequisite for inten-
sivists to responsibly balance the interests of individual 
patients against responsibilities to triage, educate and 
advance medical knowledge through research. However, 
ultimately, the creation and maintenance of a culture of 
ethical practice within each ICU is necessary to minimize 
the impact of these conflicts on patients.
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