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Correction to: Intra‑articular injections of platelet‑rich plasma 
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Correction to:  
Knee Surgery, Sports Traumatology, Arthroscopy  
https ://doi.org/10.1007/s0016 7-020-06102 -5

The article Intra‑articular injections of platelet‑rich plasma 
in symptomatic knee osteoarthritis: a consensus statement 
from French‑speaking experts, written by Florent Eymard, 
Paul Ornetti, Jérémy Maillet, Éric Noel, Philippe Adam, 
Virginie Legre‑Boyer, Thierry Boyer, Fadoua Allali, Vin‑
cent Gremeaux, Jean‑Francois Kaux, Karine Louati, Martin 
Lamontagne, Fabrice Michel, Pascal Richette, Hervé Bard 
on behalf of the GRIP (Groupe de Recherche sur les Injec‑
tions de PRP, PRP Injection Research Group), was originally 
published electronically on the publisher’s internet portal 

on 24 June 2020 without open access. With the author(s)’ 
decision to opt for Open Choice the copyright of the article 
changed on 25 October 2020 to © The Author(s) 2020 and 
the article is forthwith distributed under a Creative Com‑
mons Attribution 4.0 International License, which permits 
use, sharing, adaptation, distribution and reproduction in any 
medium or format, as long as you give appropriate credit to 
the original author(s) and the source, provide a link to the 
Creative Commons licence, and indicate if changes were 
made. The images or other third party material in this arti‑
cle are included in the article’s Creative Commons licence, 
unless indicated otherwise in a credit line to the material. If 
material is not included in the article’s Creative Commons 
licence and your intended use is not permitted by statutory 
regulation or exceeds the permitted use, you will need to 
obtain permission directly from the copyright holder. To The original article can be found online at https ://doi.org/10.1007/

s0016 7‑020‑06102 ‑5.
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view a copy of this licence, visit https ://creat iveco mmons 
.org/licen ses/by/4.0.

The original article has been corrected.
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